0199

County of Santa Cruz

PLANNING DEPARTMENT
701 OCEAN STREET, 4™ FLOOR, SANTA CRUZ, CA 95060
(831) 454-2580 FAX: (831) 454-2131  TDD: (831) 454-2123
ALVIN D. JAMES, DIRECTOR

February 14, 2001

AGENDA: February 27, 2001
Board of Supervisors
County of Santa Cruz
701 Ocean Street
Santa Cruz, California 95060

SUBJECT: REVISED RURAL ROAD STANDARDS

Members of the Board:

On December 14, 1999, your Board adopted a number of policy and ordinance amendments,
including revisions to the rural road standards, for privately maintained roadways. These
revised road standards required a drain rock surface for all roads with grades between 0 and
10%, instead of the currently required baserock surfacing. Following adoption by your Board,
this package of amendments was forwarded to the Coastal Commission for its review. In May
2000, the Coastal Commission adopted the revised road standards as a minor amendment.

On June 20, 2000, your Board directed Planning staff to present a report outlining the efforts
the Department was undertaking to educate the public and facilitate the implementation of the
recently adopted standards. Planning staff began the outreach process by first discussing the
new road standards with the Fire Chiefs Association of Santa Cruz County. As aresult of
these discussions, Planning staff reported back in September and December 2000 (Attachments
7 and 8) that the Fire Chiefs Association had a number of concerns with the adopted road
standard as well as the existing road standards in the Grading Ordinance. Planning staff
requested and your Board granted additional time to allow the Planning Department and the
Fire Chiefs Association to complete the review of the road standards and to develop any
necessary revisions prior to any additional outreach.

Background

Section 16.20.180 (Design Standards for Private Roads, Driveways and Bridges) of the County

Code, a part of the County Grading Ordinance, establishes standards for the construction of all

private roads, driveways and bridges where a Grading Permit is required (Attachment 1). This

section, adopted as a part of the original Grading Ordinance in 1977, had not been amended

since 1984, until your Board adopted the amendment to the road surfacing standard as a part of

the timber regulations (Attachment 2). As mentioned above, this amendment would require

that all new private roads and driveways with grades between 0 and 10% be surfaced with 2

inches of drain rock compacted into a4 inch sub-grade of Class |1 baserock. This new 3 7 ,



37

0200
surfacing requirement was intended to reduce the deterioration of private roads and the
resultant erosion problems.

Soon after the adoption of the new road standard by your Board, as a part of the Planning
Department’ s initial outreach, the Fire Chiefs Association expressed a concern with the new
standards. They also raised concerns about the existing standards, which had not been revised
even though significant changes to the County’s Fire Code and General Plan Fire Safety
Element were made in 1998 and 1994, respectively. Specifically, the Fire Chiefs Association
had concerns about the ability of their vehicles to negotiate roads with the proposed drain rock
surfacing. In addition, they also were concerned that the current private road, driveway and
bridge standards in the Grading Ordinance were not consistent with the County Fire Code or
the County General Plan/Local Coastal Program Land Use Plan (GP/LCP). Planning staff and
the Fire Chiefs Association have been meeting on a monthly basis to address these issues and
have crafted amendments to the Grading Ordinance which are consistent with the County Fire
Code and the County GP/LCP.

Road Standards

The proposed amendments to Section 16.20.180 (Attachment 3) modify the wording of the
section for clarity and conformity with the current Fire Code and General Plan. The following
table summarizes these changes:

all-weather 5 inches of baserock, Class Il or certain 6 inches of compacted Class Il baserock;
surface Class IV; if grade exceeds 15%, 1 /2 inches | 95% compaction required; if grade exceeds
of asphaltic concrete (or 4 inches of 15%, 2 inches of asphaltic concrete (or 4
concrete, With no sub-base); if grade inches of concrete, with no sub-base); oil
exceeds 10% and there are high erosion and screen required for al other roads with

hazards, oil and screenings can be required | grades up to 15%; all secondary access
roads require 2 inches asphaltic concrete

road 16-feet wide for roadway, 12-feet wide for 1 8-feet wide for roadways serving more
dimensions- driveway (the 16-foot wide road may be than 2 habitable structures; 12-feet wide for
width reduced to 12-feet if there are environmenta | driveways serving 2 or fewer habitable
congtraints, if turnouts (12' x 30') are structures (the 1 S-foot wide road may be
provided every 500-feet and approved by reduced to 12-feet if there are environmental
Fire Chief) constraints, if turnouts (12" x 35', with

approach and departure areas) are provided
every 500-feet and approved by Fire Chief);

ridges - width | 16-feet 20-feet; may be reduced by fire chief
consistent with Fire Code and GP/LCP
bridges - n/a 14-feet
vertical
clearance
ridges - design | H-20 loading HS-20-44 (25 ton); posted at both ends of
bridge




0201

maintenance | n/a requires all roads, driveways and bridges tO
be maintained as originaly constructed

The proposed road, driveway and bridge standards were based on the Policy 6.5.5 of the 1994
County GP/LCP (Attachment 4) and the requirements of the County Fire Prevention Code
(Chapter 7.92 - Attachment 5).

As indicated in the table above, the major areas of the amendment deal with the width and
surfacing of roads and driveways. The roadway widths specified in the proposed Grading
Ordinance have been increased to be consistent with the minimum widths established by the
GP/LCP and the Fire Prevention Code. These widths (1%feet for more than two habitable
structures and 12-feet for two or fewer habitable structures) will alow fire apparatus to gain
access to the structures in the event of an emergency while allowing residents to exit the area.
The exception clause, which allows for the reduction of the 18-foot wide roadway to 12-feet
(with approved turn-outs) in cases where there would be significant environmental impacts
resulting from meeting the full width standard, is retained with minor modifications.

The surfacing requirement has been upgraded to require oil and screened surfacing for all

roads with grades between 0 and 10%. This standard is consistent with the Fire Prevention
Code definition of ‘al-weather’ road surfacing and the intent of the 1999 amendment to reduce
the amount of erosion from new roads. While this will increase the construction cost of new
roads (and all road improvements where a grading permit is required), the property owner and
the community will benefit from the savings in long-term maintenance of the roads, the
reduction in sedimentation in area streams and the improvement in tire apparatus access.

Other minor changes to the Grading Ordinance standards include changes to the standards for
bridge construction, a requirement for permanent maintenance of the roadways and bridges
constructed under the Grading Permit and a number of wording changes that have been added
for clarity. The standards for new and replacement bridges include minimum requirements,
consistent with the Fire Prevention Code, for width, weight limit and posting. These standards
will insure that bridges are capable of supporting fire apparatus and allow adequate vehicular
access. The maintenance requirement is a new provision to insure that property owners
maintain their roads as they were constructed, thereby maintaining adequate fire, vehicular
access and proper drainage.

Discussion and Recommendation

The road surfacing standards approved by your Board in 1999 were originally proposed to be
applied to new private roads as well as to new timber harvest roads. However, the road
surfacing standards that were a part of the 1999 and 2000 packages of amendments to the
Forest Practice Rules were not approved by the California Board of Forestry. Your Board,
however, approved the amended standards for use on private roads and subsequently directed

37



0202

the Planning Department to prepare a public information and implementation program for the
new standards.

Regrettably, during the preparation of the revised road standards, staff only focused on the
road surfacing standards and did not examine the entire section for consistency with the
General Plan/Local Coastal Program Land Use Plan. In discussions with the Fire Chiefs
Association regarding the new road surfacing standard, it became apparent that additional
changes had to be made to Section 16.20.180 (Design Standards for Private Roads, Driveways
and Bridges) to bring the section into consistency with not only the GP/LCP but the Fire
Prevention Code as well. The proposed amendments to Section 16.20.180 are consistent with
the GP/LCP and are consistent with the County Fire Prevention Code.

Over the past year, Planning staff, Public Works and the Fire Chiefs Association has worked
together to identify and resolve a number of issues related to road access and fire safety. The
proposed amendments to the Grading Ordinance are a product of this collaboration. We are
continuing to meet monthly to work towards resolving other fire safety issues (Attachment 6).

Staff recommends that your Board direct the Planning Department to process the proposed
amendments to the Grading Ordinance (Attachment 3), including the required review under
CEQA and public hearings before the Planning Commission and your Board. When this
matter is brought to your Board for the public hearing, staff intends to include a program for
the implementation of the ordinance following certification by the California Coastal
Commission. This program will include educational outreach, including meetings with
neighborhood groups and road associations, and other actions to inform the public and the road
builders of the County about the new standards.

It is, therefore, RECOMMENDED that your Board:

1. Accept and file the report on amendments to County Code Section 16.20.180 (Design
Standards for Private Roads, Driveways and Bridges); and

2. Direct the Planning Department to process the suggested ordinance amendments as a
part of the current year’s work program (Attachment 3); and

3. Direct the Planning Department to include an implementation program for the new
road standards as a part of the materials for the public hearing before your Board.

Si ncerely,

Alvm D. 'Lan{%

Planning Directo

r/Ac
Recommended: j W

Susan A. Mauriello, CAO
37




Attachments; 1.

CC:

7.
8.

0203

Section 16.20.180 (Design Standards for Private Roads, Driveways and
Bridges)

. Subsection (h) of Section 16.20.180 (Design Standards for Private Roads,

Driveways and Bridges), revised December 1999

. Proposed Amendments to Section 16.20.180 (Design Standards for Private

Roads, Driveways and Bridges)
Section 6.5, Santa Cruz County General Plan/Local Coastal Program Land
Use Plan

. County Code Chapter 7.92 - Fire Prevention Code
. Letter of Ron Rickabaugh, President, Fire Chiefs Association of Santa

Cruz County, dated February 1,200 1
Letter of Alvin D. James, Planning Director, dated September 19, 2000
Letter of Alvin D. James, Planning Director, dated November 15, 2000

Fire Chiefs Association of Santa Cruz County

Public Works

37



37

0204
ATTACHMENT ¥

ly), shall have down drains. (Ord. 2500, 11/8/77; 3321,
11/23/82)

16.20.180 DESIGN STANDARDS FOR PRIVATE ROADS, DRIVEWAYS

——— o —————— " " >

(a) A1l private road and driveway construction requiring a
grading approval shall conform to the provisions of this sec-
tion. These requirements may be modified for emergency access,
temporary roads, or roads leading to an agricultural building or
well site if approved in writing by the Planning Director.

(b) Width of roadbed for a roadway shall be 16 feet minimum;
width of a driveway shall be 12 feet minimum." Where it is
environmentally infeasible to meet these criteria (due to exces-
sive grading or tree removal), a 12-foot wide all-weather road
with 12-foot wide by 30-foot long turnouts located approximately
every 500 feet may be approved with the approval of the fire
department. The distance between turnouts may be adjusted at
the discretion of the Planning Director if deemed appropriate
for reasons of topography, environment or emergency access.

(c) Minimum centerline radius shall"be 35 feet. (EXCEPTION:
Driveways which serve as access to any habitable structure and
which are 150 feet or less from the main road.)

(d) The maximum grade of the road or driveway shall not exceed
15 percent; however, grades of up to 20 percent are permitted
for up to 200 feet at a time..

(e) The structural section shall consist of a minimum 5 inches
of baserock, Class Ilor Class 1V. Class IVaggregate base
should have a minimum R value of 50, and not more than 10 per-
cent of the aggregate shall ggfs the number 2Q0 sieve.

() Where the sybgrade is designated as an expansive clayey
soil, the structural section should be determined using the
California Design Procedure.

(g) The aggregate base required by these design standards can
be omitted if the Planning Director determines that the native
material provides sufficient bearing capacity for all weather
use.

(h) In all cases, where road gradients exceed 15 percent, 1-1/2
inches of asphaltic concrete shall be provided. (EXCEPTION:
aggregate base and asphaltic concrete may be omitted if a struc-
tural section of 4 inch concrete is used.) Where road gradients
exceed 10 percent and a high erosion hazard has been identified
by field review, oil and screen may be required at the discre-
tion of the Planning Director.

Page 164~33



ATTACHMENT 7
0205

(1) Asphalt or concrete berms or their equivalent may be re-
quired to control drainage. Discharge shall be at points of
natural drainage courses with energy dissipaters installed where
necessary to prevent erosion.

(J) Entrances from private roads or driveways into private
roads shall be limited in gradient as shown by Figure 4.

adge of povi 3 .
or roedbDeod . ¢

PRIVAIE

. ROAD =

- (k) Any roadway or driveway which is more than 300 feet long
and a dead end shall have a turn-around area with a-minimum of

32 feet radius, or equivalent.

(7) A horizontal clearance of W feet and a vertical clearance
of 14 feet shall be maintained on all roadways, driveways, and
turnouts. :

(m) Where a private driveway will connect to a county-main-
tained road, an Encroachment Permit shall first be obtained from

-

the Public Works Department. -0
(n) Bridges shall be at least 16 feet wide, and shall be de-
signed by a civil engineer for a H-20 loading. If the

bridge crosses a stream or drainage channel, hydrauiic calcula-
tions based on a 100-year storm shall be submitted showing
hydraulic adequacy of the spanned cross-section of the stream or
drainage channel. (Ord. 2500, 11/8/77; 3321, 11/23/82; 3599,

11/6/84)
37

Page 16454



ATTACHMENT &2 4

(b) Within those zone districts in which timber harvesting is otherwise allowed by this

. . B 0206
Code. th tting and r val of tr th lid w roducts for commerci
purposes which reauire either a Timber Harvest Plan or a Non-industrial Timber
Management Plan shall not occur within riaarian corridors. defined as:

1) SO-feet from the bank full flow line of a perennial stream. as defined in
Section 16.30.030 of the County Code

2) 30-feet from the bank full flow line of an intermittent stream. as defined in
Section 16.30.030 of the Countv Code

(c) Notwithstanding the above. if compliance with section (b) would preclude access to

timber that is otherwise subject to harvest consistent with this section, the cutting and
I val of tr th lid w r ts for commercial purposes which reauir

either a Timber Harvest Plan or a Non-industrial Timber M anagement Plan within rinarian
corridors shall be oermitted onlv as necessary to provide access to such timber.

SECTION V

Subsection (h) of Section 16.20.180 - Design Standards for Private Roads, Driveways and
Bridges - of the County Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

ya
- = 2
.
....... 4
v, - C

i isereti i - Road surfacing shall meet the following
standards. based on the road gradient: 0 to 10 percent gradient - 2 inches of drain rock
compacted into a 4-inch sub-base of Class |1 baserock: 10- 15 percent gradient - oil and
screenings. greater than 15 percent gradient - 1 ¥2 inches asnhaltic concrete

(EXCEPTION: aggregate base and asphaltic concrete mav be omitted if a structural
-section of 4 inch concrete is used).

SECTION VI

If any section, subsection, division, sentence, clause, phrase or portion of this ordinance is for any
reason held to be invalid or unconstitutional by the decision of any court of competent jurisdiction,
such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions of this ordinance. The Board of
Supervisors of this County hereby declares that it would have adopted this Ordinance and each
section, subsection, division, sentence, clause, phrase, or portion thereof, irrespective of any such

-3-



ATTACHMENT 3

PROPOSED REVISIONS TO SECTION 16.20.180 0201

16.20.180 DESIGN STANDARDS FOR PRIVATE ROADS, DRIVEWAY S AND
BRIDGES

(a) All private road, bridge and driveway construction, including all secondary access
roadsrequired by aland division, requiring a grading approval shall conform to the
provisions of this section. These requirements may be modified for emergency access,
temporary roads or roads leading to an agricultural building or well site if approved in
writing by the Planning Director and the Fire Chief of the applicable Fire Protection
District.

(b) Unobstructed width of roadbed for a roadway serving mor e than two habitable
structures shall be +6 18 feet minimum; unobstructed width of a driveway serving two
or fewer habitable structures shall be 12-feet minimum. Where these criteria conflict
with other Chapter 16 standar ds #-is-environmentally-infeasible-to-meetthese-criteria
(due-to including excessive grading, sensitive habitats or tree removal), a 12-foot wide
all-weather road with 12-foot wide by 35 38-foot long turnouts, with approved approach
and departur e access, located approximately every 500 feet may be approved with the
approval of the fire department. The distance between turnouts may be adjusted at the
discretion of the Planning Director and the Fire Chief of the applicable Fire Protection
District if deemed appropriate for reasons of topography, environment or emergency
access.

(o) All roadways and drlveways shall have a minimum centerline radl us shall-be of 36
3§feet <

(d) The maximum grade of the road or driveway shall not exceed 45 20 percent; however,

grades efup-te-20 over 15 percent are permitted-for-up limited to stretches of 200 feet.
at-a-time.

(e) All roadways, secondary access roads and driveways shall have a T-he structura
section shall-eensist of aminimum 5 6 inches of compacted Class || baserock. ~Class-H
er—GLass—I—\L Compactlon to 95% requwed and certlfled by a licensed engmeer Glass

the—agg%eg&te—sh&ﬂ—pass—the—numbef%@@ﬁeve Exceptlons to thlS standard are as

follows:

&  i. Where the subgrade is designated as an expansive clayey soil, the structural
section should be determined using the California Design Procedure.

Page 1

37



ATTACHMENT S

&) ii. Theaggregate base required by these design standards can be omitted if the

Planning Director determines that the native material provides sufficient 0208

equivalent bearing capacity fer-all-weatheruse to that specified in (e) above, as
certified by a licensed soilsor civil engineer.

(R)(H) In al cases, where road gradients exceed 15 percent, 44 2 inches of asphaltic
concrete shall be provided placed over the baserock. (EXCEPTION: aggregate base and
asphal tic concrete may be omltted if a structural sectlon of 4 inches of concrete |s used. )

ﬁe}dfewew O|I and screen, at a minimum, may—be IS requwed over thebaserockat—the

disefeﬁeﬂ-ef:{he—lll-&ﬂﬂiﬂg—gﬁee{ef for all grades up to 15%. All secondary access
roads shall be surfaced with 2 inches of asphaltic concrete.

&)(g) Asphalt or concrete berms or their equivalent may be required to control drainage.
Discharges shall be at points of natural drainage courses with energy dissipaters installed
where necessary to prevent erosion.

&(h) Entrances from private roads or driveways into private roads shall be limited in
gradient as shown by Figure 4.

Q} Lo
<l g -
Sm - ) )
Q e "
alg _ Fgoﬁpdn‘fz
91a adsﬁf‘e‘/ma
LS [
“aoé' . - xDe rNd
— x> uie_ /——vrroi _
TE FROAD : =10 7
PRIVA R . \\Q’
’ 5 4
=105 min. --{ \&% c
A Sap
4 39

fig. 4

da(i) Any roadway or driveway which is more than 368 150 feet long and a dead end
shall have aturn-around area with a minimum of 38 36 feet unobstructed radius, or
equivalent.

B(j) A herizontal-clearance-of 16 feet-and-a- vertical clearance of 14 feet shall be
maintained on al roadways, driveways, bridges, and turnouts.

3 7 Page 2



ATTACHMENT 3

@m)(k) Where a private driveway will connect to a County-maintained road, an 0209
Encroachment Permit shall first be obtained from the Public Works Department.

&)(1) Bridges shall be at least +6 20 feet of clear width. The Fire Chief of the authority
having jurisdiction may allow the width to be reduced in accordance with the
adopted fire code and Fire Safety Element of the Santa Cruz County General Plan.
Bridges and culverts shall be designed by a civil engineer for a H-286 HS-20-44 (25 ton)
loading. The bridge weight limit shall be posted at both ends of the bridge. If the
bridge crosses a stream or drainage channel, hydraulic calculations based on a100-year
storm shall be submitted showing hydraulic adequacy of the spanned cross-section of the
stream or drainage channel.

(m) All roads, secondary access roads, driveways and bridges shall be permanently
maintained as originally constructed in conformance with these standards. Failure to
maintain all roads, secondary access roads, driveways, drainage improvements and
bridges that wer e constructed pursuant to these standards is subject to the code
enforcement provisions of Chapter 19.01 of the County Code.

Page3 3 7




Santa Cruz County General Plan ATTAGHMENT 4.

0210

To protect the public from the hazards of fire through citizen awareness, mitigating the risks of fire, responsble
fire protection planning and built-in systems for fire detection and suppression,

Policies

6.5.1 Access Standards

Require dl new structures, including additions of more than 500 square feet, to single-family dwellings on
existing parcels of record, to provide an adequate mad for fire protection in conformance with the following
standards:

(8 Access roads shall be a minimum of 18 feet wide for al access roads or driveways serving more than two
habitable structures, and 12 feet for an access road or driveway serving two or fewer habitable structures.
Where it is environmentally inadvisable to meet these criteria (due to excessive grading, tree remova or
other environmental impacts), a 12-foot wide ah-weather surface access road with 12-foot wide by 35-foot
long turnouts located approximately every 500 feet may be provided with the approval of the Fire Chief.
Exceptions: Title 19 of the Cdlifornia Administrative Code, requites that access roads from every state
governed building to a public street shall be al-weather hard-surface (suitable for use by fire apparatus)
roadway not less than 20 feet in width Such roadway shah be unobstructed and maintained only as access
to the public street

d\(b) Obstruction of the road width, as required above, including the parking of vehicles, shall be prohibited, as
required in the Uniform Fire Code.

() The access road surface shal be “dl weather”, which means a minimum of six inches of compacted
aggregate base rock, Class 2 or equivaent, certified by a licensed engineer to 95 percent compaction and
shall be maintained. Where the grade of the access road exceeds 15 percent, the base rock shall be overlain
by 2 inches of asphaltic concrete, Type B or equivaent, and shall be maintained.

(d) The maximum grade of the access road shall not exceed 20 percent, with grades greater than 15 percent not
permitted for distances of more than 200 feet a a time.

(e) The access road shal have a vertical clearance of 14 feet for its entire width and length, including turnouts.

(f) Gates shah be a minimum of 2 feet wider than the access road/driveway they serve. Overhead gate structures
shah have a minimum of 15 feet vertica clearance.

(g) An accessr cacbr driveway shall not end farther than 150 feet from any portion of a structure.

(M) A turn-around area which meets the requirements of the fire department shah be provided for access roads
and driveways in excess 91‘_ﬂ150 feet in length.

(i) No roadway shah have anixE@Emuﬁng radius of less than 50 feet. Roadways with a radius curvature of
50 to 100 feet shah require an additiona 4 feet of road width. Roadways with radius curvatures of 100 to
200 feet shall require an additional 2 feet of road width.

(j) Dranage details for the toad or driveway shah conform to current engineering practices, including erosion
control measures.

(k) Bridges shal be as wide as the road being serviced, meet a minimum load bearing capacity of 25 tons, and
have guard rails. Guard rails shah not reduce the required minimum road width. Width requirements may
be modified only with written approva from the Fire Chief. Bridge capacity shall be posted and shdl be
certified every five years by a licensed engineer. For bridges served by 12 foot access roads, approved
turnouts shah be provided at each bridge approach.

@ All private access toads, driveways, turn arounds and bridges are the responsibility of the owner(s) of record
and shall be maintained to ensure the fire department safe and expedient passage at al times.

Jwﬂ, L

37

Page 6-16 5/24/94



ATTACHMENT 4.
Chapter 6: Public Safety and Noise

0211

(m) To ensure maintenance of private access toads, driveways, turnarounds and bridges, the owner(s) of parcels
where new development is proposed shah participate in an existing road maintenance group. For those
without existing maintenance agreements, the formation of such an agreement shah be required.

(n) All access road and bridge improvements required under this section shall be made prior to permit approva,
or as a condition of permit approval.

(o) Access for any new dwelling unit or other structure used for human occupancy, including a single-family
dwellii on an existing parcel of record, shah be in the duly recorded form of a deeded access or an access
recognized by court order.

Diagrammatic representations of access standards are available at the Santa Crux County Planning Depamnent

and locdl fire agencies.

65.2 Exceptions to Access Road Standards
Exceptions to these standards may be granted a the discretion of the Fire Chief for single-family dwellings on
existing parcels of record as follows:
(@) When the existing access road is acceptable to the Fire Department having jurisdiction.
(b) In addition, any of the following mitigation methods may be required:

(1) Participation in an exigting or formation of a new road maintenance group or association.

(2) Completion of certain road improvements such as fill pot holes, resurface access road, provide turnouts,
cut back brush, etc.are made, as determined by the fire officials, and provided that the fire department
determines that adequate fire protection can till be provided

(3) Provision of approved fire protection systems as determined by the Fire Chief.

(c) The level of road improvement required shah bear a reasonable relationship to the magnitude of
development proposed.

65.3 Conditions for Project Approval

Condition approva of allnew structures and additions largerthan 500 square feet, and to single family dwellings

on exigting parcels of record to meet the following fire protection standards:

(8 Address numbers shah be posted on the property so as to be clearly visible from the access road. Where
visihbility cannot be provided, a post or sign bearing the numbers shah be set adjacent to the driveway or
access road to the property and shah have a contrasting background. Numbers shah be posted when
construction begins.

(b) Provide adequate water availability. This may be provided from an approved water system within 500 feet
of a structure, or by an individual water storage facility (water tank, svimming pool, etc.) on the property
itself. The fire department shall determine the adequacy and location of individual water storage to be
provided. Built-in fire protection features (i.e., sprinkler systems) may alow for some exemptions of other
fire protection standards when incorporated into the project,

(c) Maintain around all structures a clearance of not less than 30 feet or to the property line (whichever is a
shorter distance) of al flammable vegetation or other combustible materials; or for a greater distance as may
be prescribed by the fire department.

(d) Provide and maintain one-hdf inch wire mesh screens on dl chimneys.

(e) Automatic smoke detection devices shal be installed and maintained in accordance with the California
Building Code and local Fire Department regulations.Sprinkler and fire alarm systems, when installed, shah
meet the requirements of the local Fire Department.

(f) Provide adequate disposal of refuse. All development outside refuse collection boundaries shah be requited
to include a suitable plan for the disposa of flammable refuse. Refuse disposal shah be in accordance with
state, County or local plans or ordinances. Where practical, refuse disposal should be by methods other than
open burning.

(g) Require fire retardant roofs on al projects, as specified in the County Fire Code and the Uniform Fire Code.
Exterior wals constructed of fire resistant materias are recommended, but are not necessarily m§md

5724/94 Page 6-17



Santa Cruz County General Plan ATTACHMENT 4.

L . ) . 0212
6.5.4 Fire Protection Standards for Land Divisons Outside the Urban Services Line

Require all new minor land divisons and subdivisions outside the Urban Services Line to meet the following

fire protection standards:

(a) If a proposed building Ste is located on a dead-end access toad and is more than one-haf mile from the
nearest intersection with a through road, then secondary access must be provided. [See section 6.55,

S Standards for Dead End Roads] If building site is located within a 5 minute response time from the fire

3 department and within 500 feet of a county maintained toad, then secondary access will not be requited.

e Secondary access is defined as a 12 foot wide all-weather surface roadway with a recorded right of access

3 and maintenance agreement. The secondary access may be provided with a gate or other barrier on the

e approval of the Fire Chief. If these conditions cannot be met, development may take place only atthe Iowest

density allowed for the area by the General Plan and LCP Land Use Plan.

(b) All primary and secondary roads shall meet the requirements of this §éction and shall be maintained through
a County Service Area or a joint toad maintenance agreement with all property owners of record.

(c) Location within the response time of 20 minutes from the fire station which is responsible for serving the
parcel. Response time is defined as the length of time between the dispatch of ground fire vehicles from the
fire stationto theirarrival atthe location of the proposed structure(s). In areas exceeding 20 minutes response
time, development may take place only at the lowest density allowed by the General Plan and LCP Land
use Plan.

(d) Locate the building site outside any designated Critical Fire Hazard Area. If building sites cannot be located
outside a Critical Fire Hazard Arega, the following criteria shal be met:

(1) If the building site is served by a through access road or by secondary access, development may be
approved only at the lowest density allowed by the General Plan and LCP Land use Plan.

(2) If the parcel is on a dead-end access toad and cannot develop secondary access, development may
consist of only one single-family residence on the existing parcel of record; dl land divisons must be
denied.

(e) The project can meet the vegetation modification requirements called for by the Fire Chief, based upon an
on-site ingpection, including appropriate erosion control facilities. The homeowner must maintain this
vegetation modification in order to assure long-term protection. Land clearing or vegetation modification
which exceeds one acre, whether planned to take place prior to or after development approval, must submit
an erosion control plan for the review and approval of the County Watershed Management Section.
Vegetation modification plans shal not be alowed which introduce non-native invasive plant species, and
wherever possible should utilize native fire-resistant vegetation,

(f) The project can meet the standards established by the Fire Chief for water supply and/or water storage for
fire-fighting purposes.

(g) Mitigable Critical Fire Hazard Aress. If the project liesin a Critica Fire Hazard Area and within the area
bordered by the following access roads. From Day Vdley Road to Freedom Blvd., to Hames Road, to
Browns Valley Road to Hazel Dell Road, to Gaffey Road, down Highway 152 to Carlton road, Carlton Road
to Highway 129 and ending a Murphy mad,* and the project can meet the water storage standards, then the
development may proceed at a density as determined by the Rura Density Matrix. Mitigation was based
upon the following criteria
(1) extent of the critical fire hazard vegetation;

(2) distance to adjacent fire hazard aress;

(3) accesshility for fire-fighting equipment;

(4) ar moisture content;

(5) historic record of wildland fires;

(6) dope and terrain.

*This area has been mapped to denote areas where the fire hazard is of lesser concern, if mitigated by

vegetation modification and water supply/storage supplementation. These maps are available at Santa Crux

County Planning Department, or at the Caifornia Department of Forestry and Fire Protection headquarters

87"

Page 6-18 5124/94

RLE



ATTACHMENT 4 *
Chapter 6: Public Safety and Noise

0213

655 Standards for New Dead End Roads

Prohibit newly constructed dead-end roads without secondary access serving more than one parcel in new minor
land divisions or subdivisons which exceed the following distances from an adequate through road unless
approved by the applicable fire protection agency, the Department of Public Works, and by the Planning
Commission; in no case shdl a new dead-end road exceed 1/2 mile in length.

Urban & Suburban General Plan and LCP Land Use Plan designation 500’

Rural General Plan and LCP Land Use Plan designation 1000

Mountain General Plan and LCP Land Use Plan designation 1500’

The standard for new subdivisions of 5 or more lots shall not exceed 500 unless recommended by the applicable
fire protection agencies and the Department of Public Works, and approved by the Planning Commission.

65.6 Maintenance for Private Roads
Require the creation or expansion of County Service Areas (to provide road maintenance), toad maintenance
agreements or associations (deemed adequate to provide appropriate road maintenance) for al new private
roads, and for land divisions in rura areas served by private roads.

65.7 Certification of Adequate Fire Protection Prior to Permit Approval

(LcP) Require dl land divisons, multi-unit resdentia complexes, commerciad and industrial complexes, public
facilities and critical utilities to obtain certification from the appropriate fire protection agency that adequate fire
protection is available, prior to permit approval.

65.8 Public Facilities Within Critical Fire Hazard Areas
@cp) Discourage location of public facilities and critical utilities in Critical Fire Hazard Areas. When unavoidable,
specia precautions shal be taken to ensure the safety and uninterrupted operation of these facilities.

65.9 Consstency With Adopted Codes Required for New Development
(Lcp Require dl new development to be consistent with the Uniform Fire Code, California Building Code, and other
adopted County and local fire agency ordinance.

65.10 Land Divisons Access Requirements
(LCP) (a) Require all private roads used for either primary or secondary access to be maintained through road
maintenance agreements and/or associations or through a County Service Area
(b) /Prohibit land divisions where any new building site is located more than 1/2 mile from a through toad unless
secondary access is provided.
(c¢) In the North Coast and Bonny Doon planning areas, prohibit new land divisions where any new building
gte is located more than 1/2 mile from a publicly maintained road even where secondary access is provided.

65.11 Fire Protection Standards for Land Divisons Insde the Urban Services Line
Require al new land divisons within the Urban Services Line to be consistent with the California Fire Code,

37

5/24/94 Page 6-19



Santa Cruz County General Plan 0214

Programs ATTACHMENT 4

a. Encourage fire protection agencies to enter into first alarm response and initiate contractua agreements in
order to assure that the fire unit nearest the fire will respond on first alarm to a fire emergency. (Responsihility:
County Fire Marshal, Board of Supervisors, loca fire protection agencies)

b. Newly constructed or approved public and private toads and streets must be identified by a name or number
through a consistent countywide system, which provides for sequenced or patterned numbers and/or non-
duplicatingnamingwithinthe County. All signs shall be mounted and oriented in a uniform manner. This section
does not require any entity to rename or renumber existing roads or streets. Nor shall a roadway providing access
only to a single commercia or industrial occupancy require naming or numbering (Responsibility: Office of
Emergency Services, County Fire Marshal)

c. Define levels of fire protection services using criteria relating to distance from fire stations, density of
development and magnitude of fire risk. (Responsibility: Board of Supervisors, locd fire protection agencies)

d. Develop firebreak standards for new development to separate communities or clusters of structures from
native vegetation. (Responsibility: County Fire Marshal, Board of Supervisors, State Department of Forestry,
and local fire protection agencies)

e. Develop an overall firebreak plan in Critical Fire Hazard Areas and implement the plan in conjunction with
the Department of Forestry and fire protection agencies. (Responshility: California Department of Forestry and
Fire Protection, loca fire protection agencies, Office of Emergency Services)

f. Provide, to the maximum extent feasible, two emergency access routes for al communities, with at least one
developed to County standards. (Responsibility: Board of Supervisors, Planning Department, Public Works)

g. Upgrade water distribution systems where deficient to ensure adequate peak load water supply requirements
for fire protection within the service areas of recognized water purveyors. Priority shal be given to areas within
the Urban Services Line. (Responsibility: Water Purveyors, County Fire Department, loca fire protection
agencies, County Office of Emergency Services)

h. Give priority to areas within the Urban Services Line when planning expansion of fire protection facilities
and equipment (Responsibility: fire protection agencies, Board of Supervisors)

i. Encourage al fire protection agencies to participate in the development and implementation of a joint
communications center. (Responsibility: Board of Supervisors, Communications Director, County Fire
Department, California Department of Forestry and Fire Protection, local fire protection agencies, County
Office of Emergency Services)

j. Update annualy the “Fire Protection Improvement Program and Long-Range Plan for Santa Crux County.”
(Responsibility: Board of Supervisors, County Fire Marsha, County Office of Emergency Services)

8¢
Page 6-20 5/24/94

by



. 0215
Chapter 6: Public Safety and Noise

(LCP)

(LCP)

3/24/94

ATTACHMENT 4 *
k. Encourage the State Department of Forestry to provide land and air tire-fighting facilities and equipment
adequate to meet estimated peak fire demands. (Responsibility: Board of Supervisors, County Fire Marshal)

1. Encourage fire protection agencies to establish educationa fire prevention programs in order to have the
public recognize their responsibility in preventing fires. (Responsibility: California Department of Forestry and
Fire Protection, County Fire Marsha, locd fire protection agencies, County Office of Emergency Services)

m. Review and update on a periodic basis the countywide Disaster Contingency Plan. Include the appropriate
County agencies in all phases of disaster contingency planning. (Responsibility: Board of Supervisors, Office
of Emergency Services)

n. Update the Critical Fire Hazard Map as new site-specific information becomes available whichmore precisely
defmes these areas.. (Responsibility: Planning Department, County Fire Department, California Department of
Forestry and Fire Protection, loca fire protection agencies)

0. Identify high fire risk areas within the Urban Services Line and rural areas with topography, hazardous fuels,
structures, density similar to those found in the Oakland Hills Fire of 1991. (Responsibility: Planning
Department, County Fire Marshal, local fire protection agencies, Board of Supervisors)

p. In cooperation with fire protection agencies, develop coordinated action programs to reduce the hazard to

existing development in critical fire hazard areas such as the following:

(1) Assessment digtricts to finance road improvements and secondary access. water storage, distribution and
hydrant facilities; purchase of pumper trucks and/or vegetation clearance and fire break construction.

(2) Fire hazard inspection and code enforcement.

(3) Public education programs on fire prevention.

(Responsibility: Planning Department, County Fire Marshal, loca fire protection agencies, Board of Supervisors)

g. Amend and update the Santa Cruz County General Plan Fire Safety Element as needed, to reflect fire code

amendments. (Responsibility: Board of Supervisors, County Fire Marshd, locd fire protection agencies,
Planning Department)

37

Page 6-21



Chapter 7.92

FIRE PREVENTION CODE*

Sections;
792.010
7.92.015

7.92.020

7.92.030

7.92.040

7.92.050

7.92.060

7.92.070

7.92.080

7.92.090

7.92.100

7.92.110

UFC section 101.1
amended-Title.

UFC Section 108 added
and amended-
Reference to appendix.
UFC Section 103.1.4
Deleted-Appeals.

UFC Section 103.1.4.1.1
added-Establishment
of board of appesals.
UFC Section 103.1.4.1.2
added—A ppealable
decisions.

UFC Section 103.1.4.1.3
added-Initiating
appeal.

UFC Section 103.1.4.1.4
added-Stay of order.
UFC Section 103.1.4.1.5
added-Hearing of
appeal.

UFC Section 103.1.4.1.6
added-Decision of the
board of appeals.

UFC Section 103.1.4.1.7
added-Time of
decision.

UFC Section 103.2.1.1,
No. 4 amended-
General.

UFC Section 105.1
amended--Scope.

*  Prior ordinance: Ord. 4384.

37

349

7.92.115

792.120

7.92.130

7.92.13s

7.92.140

792.150

7.92.160

7.92.170

7.92.180

7.92.185

7.92.190

7.92.193

7.92.196

7.92.198

ATTACHMENT 5

0216

UFC Section 1053
added and amended-
Application for permit,
UFC Section 105.8
amended-Per mit
required.

UFC Section 202
amended—**A”
definitions.

UFC Section 203 added
and amended-%"”
definitions.

UFC Section 204
amended—*“C”
definitions.

UFC Section 207
amended—“F»
definitions.

UFC Section 209
amended—“H”
definitions.

UFC Section 221
amended—*“T”
definitions.

UFC Section 901.2.2.1
amended-Fire
apparatus access.
UFC Section 901.45.1
added-Prohibition of
unauthorized signage.
UFC Section 902.2.2.1
amended-Dimensions.
UFC Section 902.2.2.5
added and amended-
Bridges.

Section 903.4.5 added-
Painting.

Section 903.5 added-
Removal from service.

(Santa Cruz county 9-99)



7.92.010

7.92200

7.92.210

7.92220

792.230

7.92240

7.92.250

7.92.260

7.92.270

7.92.280

7.92.290

7.92.300

(Santa Cruz County 9-99)

UFC Section 1003.12
amended-Standards.
WC Section 1003.2
through 1003.2.8
deleted-Required
installations.

UFC Section 1003.5
added-Required
installation of automatic
sprinkler systems.
UFC Section 1109.7
amended--Sparks from
chimneys.

UFC Section 5204.5.2
amended-M aximum
capacity within
established limits.
UFC Section 7401.6.4
No. 1 amended—
Securing compressed
gas containers, cylinders
and tanks.

UFC Section 7701.1
amended-Scope.
UFC Section 7902
amended-L ocations
where aboveground
tanks are prohibited.
UFC Section 8204.2
amended-M axhnum
capacity within
established limits.
UPC Appendix 11-A
amended--Suppression
and control of
hazardous fire areas,
Section 7, spark
arresters.

UFC Section 9501
added—Violation—
Public nuisance—
Abatement-Costs.

ATTACHMENT &
0217

792.310 UFC Section 9502
added—Violation—
Penalty.

792.320 UFC Section 9503
added-Enfor cement.

7.92.010 UFC Section 101.1
amended-Title.
UFC Section 101.1 is amended to read as
follows:

This code shall be known as the
“FIRE CODE OF THE COUNTY OF
SANTA CRUZ” and, may be cited as
such, and will be referred to herein as
“this code.” The Fire Code of the County
of Santa Cruz shall be the 1997 Edition
of the Uniform Fire Code (UFC), includ-
ing the appendices, supplements, and
errata published by the Internationa Fire
Code Indtitute, subject to the amendments
set out in Chapter 7.92 of the Santa Cruz
County Code.

(Ord. 4549 § 1 (part), 1999)

7.92.015 UPC Section 108 added
and amended-Reference
to appendix.

UFC Section 108 is added and amended
to read as follows:

References to Appendix. When this
code references the appendix, the provi-
sions in the appendix shall apply as
adopted.

(Ord. 4549 § 1 (part), 1999)

7.92.020 UPC Section 103.1.4
Deleted-Appeals.
UFC Section 103.1.4 is deleted. (Ord.
4549 § 1 (part), 1999)

350

37

) (&M' iy,



3%

792.030 UFC Section 103.1.4.1.1
added——Establishment of
board of appeals.

Section 103.1.4.1 is added to read as

follows:

The Board of Appedls is established
under the provisions of Chapter 2.100 of
the Santa Cruz County, Code.
(Ord. 4549 § 1 (part), 1999)
7.92.040 UFC Section 103.1.4.1.2
added-Appealable
decisions.

Section 103.1.4.2 is added to read as
follows:

Any order of the Fiie Chief shal be
appedable to the Fire Code Board of Ap-
peals as established by any party benefi-
cidly interested, except for orders affect-
ing acts or conditions which, in the opin-
ion of the Fiie Chief, pose an immediate
threat to life, property, or the environ-
ment as a result of panic, fire, explosion
or release.

(Ord. 4549 § 1 (part), 1999)

7.92.050 UFC Section 103.1.4.1.3

added-Initiating appeal.
Section 103.1.4.3 is added to read as

follows:

Any beneficidly interested party has
the right to appeal the order served by
the Fire Chief by filing a written *NO-
TICE OF APPEAL” with the office of
the Fire Chief within ten days after ser-
vice of such written order.

If the tenth day falls on a Saturday,
Sunday, or federal holiday, the time to

351

ATTACHMENT D

7.92.030

file is extended to the next working day.
The notice shall state the order appealed
from, the identity and mailing address of
the appellant, and the specific grounds
upon which the appedl is taken.

(Ord. 4549 § 1 (part), 1999)

7.92.060 UFC Section 103.1.4.1.4

added—Stay of order.
Section 103.1.4.1.4 is added to read as

follows:

The filing of a properly completed
notice of appea shall have the effect of
dtaying the implementation of the order
appealed until the final decision of ap-
peal, except for the orders affecting acts
or conditions which in the opinion of the
Fiie Chief, pose an immediate threat to
life, property, or the environment as a
result of panic, fire, explosion, or release.

(Ord. 4549 § 1 (part), 1999)

7.92.070 UFC Section 103.1.4.15

added-Hearing of appeal.
Section 103.1.4.1.5 is added to read as

follows:

Following is the process for estab-
lishing and hearing appedls.

L The Board of Appedls, or the
secretary thereof, shall set the matter to
be heard at a date within thiiy days of
receipt of such notice of appeal. Written
notice of the time and place set for hear-
ing shall be served on the appellant by
first class mail to the mailing address
given in the notice of appeal at least five
days prior to the date set for the hearing.
The Fiie Chief shall transmit to the

(Santa Cruz county 9-99)

0218



7.92.070

Board of Appeals al records related to
the appedl.

2. At the hearing on the apped,
the appellant shall, in the first instance
present evidence in support of the
grounds enumerated in her/his notice of
apped. The Fire Chief shall next present
evidence in support of her/his order. The
appellant and the Fire Chief shall each
have one opportunity to rebut the evi-
dence presented by the other. The hear-
ing shdl be de novo in al respects.
(Ord. 4549 § 1 (part), 1999)
7.92.080 UFC Section 103.1.4.1.6
added-Decision of the
board of appeals.

Section 103.1.4.1.6 is added to read as
follows:

Upon hearing the apped, the Board
of Appeals may issue a decision affirm-
ing, modifying or vacating the order of
the Fiie Chief. The decision shal be in
writing and shall be served upon the
appellant by mail in the manner provided
for in the notice of hearing pursuant to
section 7.92.103.1.4.5 of the Uniform
Fire Code.

(Ord. 4549 § 1 (part), 1999)

7.92.090 UFC Section 103.1.4.1.7

added-Time of decision.
Section 103.1.4.1.7 is added to read as

follows:

The Board of Appeals shal have the
power to continue any hearing and may,
in its discretion, take the appeal under
submission. The Board of Appeals shall
render a decision not later than the sev-

(Santa Cruz county 9-99)

ATTACHMENT B

enth day following the date the matter
was taken under submission, and forth-
with notify the interested parties as previ-
oudy set forth.
(Ord. 4549 § 1 (part), 1999)
792.100 UFC Section 103.2.1.1, No.
4 amended-General.
UFC Section 103.2.1.1, No. 4 isamended
to read as follows:

4., The ingtalation and mainte-
nance of automatic, manual and other
private fire dlarm systems and fire extin-
guishing equipment. EXCEPTION: For
resdentia congtruction projects of 500
square feet or less within the unincorpo-
rated area, the enforcing authority shall
be the Planning Director of the County
of Santa Cruz or hisher designee.
(Ord. 4549 § 1 (part), 1999)
7.92.110 UFC Section 105.1
amended-Scope.

UFC Section 105.1 is amended to read as
follows:

Permits shal be in accordance with
Section 105 or other provisions of this
code as required by the jurisdiction hav-
ing authority.

(Ord. 4549 § 1 (part), 1999)

7.92.115 UFC Section 105.3 added

and amended—

Application for permit.
UFC Section 105.3 is added and amend-

ed to read as follows:

Applications for permits, when re-
quired by the Chief, shall be made to
bureau of fire prevention in such form

0219

Py



and detail as described by the bureau.
Applications for permits shal be accom-
panied by such plans as required by the
bureau.
(Ord. 4549 § 1 (part), 1999)
792.120 UFC Section 105.8
amended-Per mit
required.
UFC Section 105.8 is amended to read as
follows:

A permit shal be obtained from the
bureau of fire prevention prior to engag-
ing in the following activities, operations,
practices or functions when required by
the fire district.

(Ord. 4549 § 1 (part), 1999)

7.92.130 UFC Section 202

amended—*“A” definitions.
UFC Section 202 is amended as follows:

By adding the following definition after the
inition of “ALARM ZONE”:

ALL WEATHER SURFACE shdl
be a minimum of 6” of compacted Class
Tl base rock for grades up to and includ-
ing 5%, oil and screened for grades up to
and including 15%, and asphaltic con-
crete for grades exceeding 15%, but in
no case exceeding 20%.

By adding the following definition after
the definition of “ATRIUM”:

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTA-
TIVES shall mean those persons de-
scribed in Sections 103.2.1.2 and
103.2.2.2 of the Uniform Fire Code.

(Ord. 4549 § 1 (part), 1999)

3%

353

ATTACHMENT 5

7.92.115

7.92.135 UFC Section 203 added
and amended—*“B”
definitions.

UFC Section 203 is added and amended
as follows. By adding the following defini-

tion after the definition of “BREAK”:

BRIDGE shdl be defined as a struc-
ture designed to carry a roadway over a
depression or obstacle.
(Ord. 4549 § 1 (part), 1999)
7.92.140 UFC Section 204
amended—*“C” definitions.
UFC Section 204 is amended as follows:
By adding the following definition before
the definition of “CARCINOGEN”:

CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE
shall mean the Uniform Building Code as
adopted and amended by the State of
Cdifornia, promulgated by the Interna-
tiond Conference of Building Officials.

By adding the following definition after
the definition of “CALIFORNIA BUILD-
ING CODE":

CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE shal
mean the Uniform Fire Code as adopted
and amended by the State of California,
promulgated by the International Fire
Code Indtitute.

By adding the following definition after
the definition of “CONVERSION RANGE
OIL BURNER".

(Santa Cruz county 9-99)

0220



7.92.140

CORPORATION COUNSEL shdll
mean the County Counsel as retained or
appointed by the County of Santa Cruz.

(Ord. 4549 § 1 (part), 1999)

792.150 UFC Section 207

amended-T” definitions.
UFC Section 207 is amended as follows:

By adding the following definition after the

defmition of ‘FIRE BARRIER”:

FIRE CHIEF shall mean the Chief
Officer of the Fire Protection District
within the unincorporated territory of its
jurisdiction area and shall mean the
County Fire Marsha within the unincor-
porated territory of the County of Santa
Cruz which is not within the jurisdiction
area of a Fire Protection District.

By changing the definition of “FIRE
DEPARTMENT” to read as follows:

FIRE DEPARTMENT shdl mean
the Office of the Fire Marsha of the
County of Santa Cruz or any regularly
organized Fire Protection District within
its respective jurisdictional area.

By adding the following definition after
the definition of ‘FIRE POINT":

FIRE SAFETY ELEMENT isa
document contained within the Genera
Plan of Santa Cruz County as adopted
specifying certain minimum fire safety
requirements within the unincorporated
aress of the County of Santa Cruz.

(Ord. 4549 § 1 (part), 1999)

(Santa Cruz County 9-99)

ATTACHMENT D

7.92.160 UFC Section 209
amended—“H”
definitions.

UFC Section 209 is amended by chang-
ing the definition of ‘HAZARDOUS FIRE

AREA” to read as follows:

HAZARDOUS FIRE AREA is land
which is covered with grass, grain, brush,
or forest, whether privately or publicly
owned, which is so Situated or is of such
inaccessible location that a fire originat-
ing upon such land would present an
abnormally difficult job of suppresson or
would result in great and unusual damage
through fire or resulting erosion. The
declaration of a hazardous fire area shall
be made by the chief for purposes of this
code and shall not contradict with haz-
ardous fire aress as defined by the Cali-
fornia Public Resources Code.

(Ord. 4549 § 1 (part), 1999)

7.92.170 UFC Section 221

amended-T definitions.
UFC Section 221 is amended by adding

the following definition after the definition

of “THERMAL INSECTICIDAL FOG-

GING”:

TOTAL FLOOR AREA isthe sum
of al stories, exclusive of area separa-
tions.
(Ord. 4549 § 1 (part), 1999)
7.92.180 UFC Section 901.2.2.1
amended-Fire apparatus
access.

UFC Section 901.2.2.1 is amended to
read as follows:

0221 _

g“*’“"?“*m

37



37

Plans for fire apparatus access roads
shal be submitted to the fire department
for review and approval prior to con-
gruction. When grading work is needed
for the access road(s) within the jurisdic-
tion of Santa Cruz County, application
for a grading permit shall be made with
the Santa Cruz County Planning Depart-
ment pursuant to the Santa Cruz County
Grading Ordinance. Such Permits shall
be reviewed by the Santa Cruz County
Environmenta Coordinator as required.

(Ord. 4549 § 1 (part), 1999)

7.92.185 UFC Section 901.4.5.1

added-Prohibition of

unauthorized signage.
UFC Section 901.4.5.1is added to read

as follows:

Posting of any road naming signs not
authorized by the Office of Street Nam-
ing and Numbering of the County of
Santa Cruz, and the Fire Chief is prohib-
ited.

(Ord. 4549 § 1 (part), 1999)

7.92.190 UFC Section 902.2.2.1

amended-Dimensions.
UFC Section 902.2.2.1 is amended to

read as follows:

Fire Apparatus access roads shall
have an unobstructed width of not less
that 20 feet (6096 mm) and an unob-
structed vertical clearance of not less
than 14 feet (47.927 mm).

EXCEPTIONS: 1. Outside of the
Urban Services Line as established by
the County of Santa Cruz, access roads
shdl be a minimum of 18 feet wide for

ATTACHMENT 5

7.92.180

all access roads or driveways serving
more than two habitable structures, and
12 feet for an access road or driveway
serving two or fewer habitable structures.
Where it is environmentaly inadvisable
to meet these criteria (due to excessive
grading, tree removal or other environ-
mental impacts), a 12-foot wide all-
weather surface access road with 12-foot
wide by 35-foot long turnouts located
approximately every 500 feet may be
provided with the approval of the Fiie
Chief.

NOTE: Title 19 of the California
Administrative Code requires that access
roads from every state governed building
to a public street shall be al-weather
hard-surface (suitable for use by fire
apparatus) roadway not less than 20 feet
in width. Such roadway shall be unob-
structed and maintained only as access to
the public street.

2. Vertical clearance may be
reduced, provided such reduction does
not impair access by fire apparatus and
approved signs are installed and main-
tained indicating the established vertical
clearance when approved by the chief.

Vertical clearances or widths shall be
increased when, in the opinion of the
chief, vertical clearances or widths are
not adequate to provide fire apparatus
access.

(Ord. 4549 § 1 (part), 1999)

(Santa Cruz County 9-99)

0222



7.92.193

% 792.193

UFC Section 902.2.2.5
added and amended—
Bridges.

UFC Section 902.2.2.5 is added and

amended to read as follows:

902.2.2.5.1 General. When a bridge
is required to be used as part of afire
apparatus access road, it shall be con-
structed and maintained in accordance
with nationally recognized standards. See
Article 90. Standard a.1.1. The bridge
shall be designed for a live load suffi-
cient to carry the imposed loads of fire
apparatus.

902.2.2.5.2 Weight. Every private
bridge hereafter constructed shall be
designed for a- minimum of HS20-44
loading as prescribed by the American
Association of State Highways and
Transportation Officials. Vehicle load
limits shall be posted at both entrances to
bridges when required by the chief.

902.2.2.5.3 Height. Clear vertical
clearance shall be not less than 14 fest.
In situations where a grade change re-
quires a greater vertica clearance, such
additional clearance shall be determined
by the Fiie Chief.

902.2.2.5.4 Width. All bridges shall
be a minimum of 20 feet of clear width.
The Chief may allow the width to be
reduced for access to U-I, U-2 or R-3
occupancies in accordance to the Fire
Safety Element of the Santa Cruz County
General Plan.

902.2.2.5.5 Certification. Every pri-
vate bridge hereafter constructed shall be

(Santa Cruz county 9-99)

356

7.92.196

7.92.198

ATTACHMENT 5

engineered by a licensed civil or structur-
a engineer and approved by the Chief.
Certification that the bridge complies
with the design standards required by this
section and the identified standards shall
be provided by the licensed engineser, in
writing to the Chief.

902.2.2.5.6 Recertification. Every
private bridge shal be recertified every
ten years or whenever deemed necessary
by the Chief. Such recertification shdl be
in accordance with the requirements of
902.2.2.5.5

902.2.2.5.7 Existing Private Bridg-
es. An existing private bridge not con-
forming to these regulations may be
required to conform when dterations or
additions are made to existing structures
served by a non-conforming bridge.

902.2.2.5.8 Fees. All fees charged for
the purpose of certification or recertifica
tion required under this section shall be
a the owners expense.

(Ord. 4549 § 1 (part), 1999)

Section 903.45 added-
Painting.
Section 903.4.5 is added to read as fol-

lows:

903.4.5 Painting of Fire Hy-
drants. When required by the Chief,
fire hydrants shall be painted in
accordance with NFPA 291.

(Ord. 4549 § 1 (part), 1999)

Section 903.5 added-
Removal from service.
Section 903.5 is added to read as follows:

0223

37



7.92.9035 Removed from service
or otherwise modified. The Chief shall
be notified whenever any portion of the
water supply system for fire protection,
including fire hydrants, is altered, re-
moved from service, or otherwise modi-
fied.

(Ord. 4549 § 1 (part), 1999)

7.92.200 UFC Section 1003.1.2

amended--Standards.
UFC Section 1003.1.2 is amended to read

as follows;

Fire extinguishing systems shall
comply with U.B.C Standards 9-I.

Exceptions:

L Automatic fire extinguishing
systems not covered by the Building
Code shall be approved and installed
in accordance with approved stan-
dards.

2. Automatic sprinkler systems
may be connected to domestic water-
supply main when approved by the chief,
provided the domestic water supply is of
adequate pressure, capacity, and sizing
for the combined domestic and sprinkler
requirements. In such case, the sprinkler
system connection shal be made between
the public water main or meter and the
building shut-off valve, and there shall
not be intervening valves or connections.
The fire department connection may be
omitted when approved by the chief.

3. Automatic sprinkler systems
in Group R Occupancies four stories or
less may be in accordance with the

37

357

pTACHMENT B ¢

7.92.198

Building Code requirements for residen-
tid sprinkler systems. (See U.B.C. Stan-
dard 9-3))

(Ord. 4549 § 1 (part), 1999)

7.92.210 UFC Section 1003.2
through 10033.8 deleted—
Required ingallations.
UFC Sections 1003.2 through 1003.2.8
are deleted. (Ord. 4549 § 1 (part), 1999)

7.92.220 UFC Section 10035
added-Required
installation of automatic
sprinkler systems.

Section 1003.5 is added to read as fol-
lows:

1003.5 General. Automatic sprinkler
systems shdl be provided in accor-
dance with the provisions of this
section and in accordance with cur-
rent fire department standards and
nationally  recognized standards
(Standards 13, 13D, and 13R of the
Nationa Fire Protection Association,
NFPA)

10035.1 Definitions. An automatic
sprinkler system shal be provided in all
new dructures as follows:

1003.5.1.1 In al Group A, Group B,
Group E, Group F, Group H, Group I,
Group M, Group R, Group S and Group
U occupancies, as defined in the Cdifor-
nia Building Code, Table 3-A, regardless
of type of congtruction or floor area.

1003.5.1.2 Single Floor Areaisthe

area of any one floor, exclusive of area
separations.

(Santa Cruz County 9-99)

0224



7.92.220

1003.5.1.3 Total Floor Area is the
sum of the area of all stories, exclusive
of area separations.

10035.2 New Structures. An Auto-
matic Sprinkler System shall be provided
in al new occupancies as defined in
Table 3-A of the California Building
Code regardless of type of construction
and/or floor area. Any occupancy not
specificaly mentioned, shall be included
in the group which it most nearly resem-
bles, based on the proposed life and fire
hazard.

EXCEPTIONS: 1. Private garages,
carports, sheds not more than 1,000
sguare feet (93 m2) of total floor area
shall not require fire sprinklers where
they are detached and separate from
other structures and provided with exteri-
or wall and opening protection as per the
Cdlifornia Building Code as adopted and
amended, Table No. 3-A for Group U-l
occupancies.

2. Agricultural buildings as
defined in Appendix Chapter 3, Divison
I1, of the California Building Code not
exceeding 2,000 square feet (186 m2),
not exceeding 7.92 feet (7620 mm) in
height, having a clear unobstructed side
yard exceeding 60 feet (18,280 mm) in
all directions, and located within an
Agricultural zoned digtrict, as defined in
the Santa Cruz County Planning Code, or
as exempted by the Fire Chief, shall not
require fire sprinklers.

3. Group B and Group M Occu-
pancies not more than 500 square feet
(46.5 m2) shall not require fire sprinklers

(Santa Cruz county 9-99)

358

o
ATTACHMENT 5

where they are detached and separate
from other structures and provided with
exterior wall and opening protection as

per the Cdifornia Building Code, Table
5A.

4. Greenhouses of non-combusti-
ble construction shall not require fire
sprinklers.

1003.53 Existing Structures. An
automatic sprinkler system shdl be pro-
vided in existing structures when, after
the effective date of this Code, a building
permit is issued to alow additions to be
made to an existing structure so as to
increase the tota floor area of the struc-
ture or the single floor area of any floor
of the structure as follows.

100353.1 Group “A” Occupancies.

1003.53.1.1 Drinking establish-
ments. An automatic sprinkler system
shall be installed in rooms used by the
occupants for the consumption of alco-
holic beverages and unseparated accesso-
ry uses where the tota floor area of such
unseparated rooms and assembly uses
exceeds 5,000 square feet (465 m?2). For
uses to be considered separate, the sepa-
ration shall not be less than as required
for a one-hour occupancy separation. The
area of other uses shall be included un-
less separated by at least a one-hour
occupancy separation.

1003.5.3.1.2 Basements. An auto-
matic sprinkler system shall be installed
in basements classified as a Group A
Occupancy when the basement is larger

0225

37

il



3%7

than 1,500 square feet (139 m2) in floor
area.

100353.13 Exhibition and display
rooms. An automatic sprinkler system
shall be ingtaled in Group A Occupan-
cies which have more than 12,000 square
feet (1114.84 m2) of floor area which
can be used for exhibition or display
pUrpOSeS.

1003.5.3.1.4 Stairs. An automatic
sprinkler system shall be installed in
enclosed usable space below or over a
stairway inaGroup A, Division2,2.1,3
and 4 Occupancies.

1003.5.3.1.5 Multi-theater complex-
es. An automatic fire sprinkler system
shall be ingtaled in every building con-
taining a multi-thester complex regard-
less of additiona square footage.

1003.5.3.1.6 Amusement buildings.
An automatic sprinkler system shall be
ingalled in dl amusement buildings re-
gardless of additional square footage. The
main water-flow switch shall be electri-
caly supervised. The sprinkler main cut
off vave shall be supervised. When the
amusement building is temporary, the
sprinkler water-supply system may be of

approved temporary type.

EXCEPTION: An automatic sprin-
kler system need not be provided when
the floor area of a temporary amusement
building is less than 1,000 square feet
(92.9 m2) and the exit travel distance
from any point is less than 50 feet (15
240 mm)

359

ATTACHVMENT B °

7.92.220

1003.5.3.1.7 Stages. All stages shall
be sprinklered regardless of additional
square footage. Such sprinklers shall be
provided throughout the stage and in
dressing rooms, workshops, storerooms
and other accessory spaces contiguous to
such stages.

Exceptions:

1 Sprinklers are not required for
stages 1,000 square feet (92.9 m2) or less
in area and 50 feet (15 240 mm) or less
in height where curtains. scenery or other
combustible hangings are not retractable
verticaly. Combustible hangings shal be
limited to a single main curtain, borders,
legs and a single back drop.

2. Under stage area less than 4
feet (1219 mm) in clear height used
exclusively for chair or table storage and
lined on the inside with 5/8-inch (16
mm) Type X gypsum wall board or an
approved equal.

1003.2.3.8 Smoke-protected assem-
bly seating. All areas enclosed with
walls and ceilings in buildings or struc-
tures containing smoke-protected assem-
bly seating shal be protected with an ap-
proved automatic sprinkler system.

EXCEPTION: Press boxes and stor-
age facilities less than 1,000 square feet
(92.9 m2) in area and in conjunction
with outdoor seating facilities where dl
means of egress in the seating area are
essentidly open to the outside.

(Santa Cruz county 9-99)

0226



7.92.220

100353.2 GROUP “B” OCCU-
PANCIES

1003.5.3.2.1 An automatic sprinkler
system shal be ingtdled when the occu-
pancy has over 6,000 square feet (556
m2) of total floor area regardless of type
of congtruction

1003.5.3.2.2 An automatic sprinkler
system shal be ingtalled in any enclosed
usable space below or over a stairway.

10035333 An automatic sprinkler
system shal be ingtalled in al basements
when the basement is larger than 1,500
square feet (139 m2).

1003.533 GROUP “E” OCCU-
PANCIES

1003533.1 An automatic sprinkler
system shall be ingtalled when the occu-
pancy has over 6,000 square feet (556
m2) of total floor area regardless of type
of congtruction.

1003.533.2 An automatic sprinkler
system shal be ingtalled in any enclosed
usable space below or over a stairway
(see section 904.2.3.4 of the Building
Code).

1003.533.3 An automatic sprinkler
system shal be ingtalled in all basements
when the basement is larger than 1,500
square feet (139 m2).

(Santa Cruz County 9-99)

360

ATAGHMENT )

0227

1003.53.4 GROUP “F” OCCU-
PANCIES

1003.5.3.4.1 An automatic sprinkler
system shall be ingtalled when the occu-
pancy has over 6,000 square feet (556
m2) of total floor area regardless of type
of construction.

100353.43 An automatic sprinkler
system shah be ingtalled in any enclosed
usable space below or over a stairway.

100353.43 An automatic sprinkler
system shdl be installed in al basements
when the basement is larger than 1,500
square feet (139 m2).

1003.5.3.5 GROUP “H” OCCU-
PANCIES

1003535.1 An automatic fire-extin-
guishing system shall be installed in
Group H, Divisons 1, 2, 3, and 7 Occu-
pancies.

1003.5.3.5.2 An automatic fire-extin-
guishing system shall be installed in
Group H, Divison 4 Occupancies having
afloor area of more than 3,000 square
feet (279 m2).

10035.353 An automatic fire-extin-
guishing system shall be installed
throughout buildings containing Group
H, Divison 6 Occupancies. The design
of the sprinkler system shal not be less
than that required under the Building
Code (see U.B.C Standard 9-1) for the
occupancy hazard classification as fol-
lows:

inw?""’“ &

87



ATTACHMENT B

7.92.220 0228

LOCATION OCCUPANCY HAZARD 1003535.7 An automatlc Sprl nkler
CLASSIFICATION system shall be installed in all basements

Fabricati ordi Hazard Groun 2 when the basement is larger than 1,500

a;l:zcamn rdinary Hazard (Group square feet (139 m2).

Service Ordinary Hazard Group 2 1003.5.3.6 GROUP ‘“I” OCCUPAN-

Corridors

CIES.

Storage rooms
without
dispensing

Ordinary Hazard Group 2

1003.5.3.6.1 An automatic sprinkler
system shall be installed in Group |
Occupancies.

Storage rooms
with dispensing

Extra Hazard Group 2

Exception: In jails, prisons and
reformatories, the piping system may be
dry, provided a manudly operated valve
is installed a a continuously monitored
location. Opening the valve will cause

Exit corridors

Ordinary Hazard Group 2 *

*When the design area of the sprinkler system
consists of a corridor protected by one row of
sprinklers, the maximum number of sprinklers that
needs to be calculated is 13.

37

1003.5.3.5.4 An automatic sprinkler
system shdl be ingtaled in rooms where
flammable or combustible liquids are
stored or handled in excess of the quanti-
ties set forth in Table 3-D of the Build-
ing Code, or any combination of flamma-
ble liquids totaling 240 gallons, as de-
fined in the Uniform Fiie Code. Build-
ings and structures to which additions,
aterations or repairs are made shall
comply with dl the requirements of this
section.

1003.5.3.5.5 An automatic sprinkler
system shall be installed in paint spray
booths or rooms and for special provi-
sions on hazardous chemicals, magne-
sum and calcium carbide, see Article 45,
48, 49 and 50.

1003.5.3.5.6 An automatic sprinkler
system shal be installed in any enclosed
usable space below or over a stairway.

361

the piping system to be charged. Sprin-
kler heads in such system shall be
equipped with afusible element or the
system shall be designed as required for
deluge systems in U.B.C. Standard 9-I.

100353.7 GROUP “M” OCCU-
PANCIES

100353.7.1 An automatic sprinkler
system shdl be ingtalled when the occu-
pancy has over 6,000 square feet (556
m?2) of total floor area, regardless of type
of construction.

1003.5.3.7.2 An automatic sprinkler
system shdll be ingtdled in any enclosed
usable space below or over a stairway.

1003.5.3.7.3 An automatic sprinkler
system shall be installed in al basements
when the basement is larger than 1,500
square feet (139 m2).

(Santa Cruz County 9-99)



7.92.220

100353.8 GROUP “R”
PANCIES

OCCU-

1003.5.3.8.1 Group R - Division 1

1003.5.3.8.1.1 An automatic sprinkler
system shall be instaled when additions
cause the structure to exceed 6,000
square feet (556 m2), of total floor area
regardiess of type of congtruction.

100353.8.12 An automatic sprinkler
system shal be ingtalled in any enclosed
usable space below or over a stairway.

100353.8.13 An automatic sprinkler
system shdl be instaled in dl basements
when the basement is larger than 1,500
square feet (139 m2)

1003.5.3.8.2 Group R - Division 3

1003.5.3.8.2.1 Plans shall be submit-
ted to the enforcing agency for review
and permit for any additions or alter-
ations to an existing dwelling equipped
with an automatic sprinkler system.

Such additions or alterations may
require modifications or additions to the
existing automatic sprinkler system.

1003.5.3.8.2.2 An automatic sprinkler
system shal be ingtalled in any dwelling
when more than 75% of the exterior
walls are replaced, rebuilt or atered in
any way with the exception of replace-
ment of wall coverings.

(Santa Cruz county 9-99)

362

KTTACHMENT &

100353.9 GROUP “S’
PANCIES

OCCU-

1003.5.3.9.1 An automatic sprinkler
system shall be installed when the occu-
pancy has over 6,000 square feet (556
m2) of total floor areg, regardless of type
of congtruction.

1003.5.3.9.2 An automatic sprinkler
system shall be ingtaled in any enclosed
usable space below or over a stairway.

100353.93 An automatic sprinkler
system shal be ingtaled in al basements
when the basement is larger than 1,500
square feet (139 m2).

100353.10 GROUP “” OCCU-
PANCIES

1003.53.10.1 An automatic sprinkler
system shall be installed when the occu-
pancy has over 6,000 square feet (556
m2) of total floor area, regardless of type
of construction.

1003.5.3.10.2 An automatic sprinkler
system shal be instaled in any enclosed
usable space below or over a stairway.

1003.53.103 An automatic sprinkler
system shal be ingtaled in al basements
when the basement is larger than 1,500
square feet (139 m2).

10035.4 Special Provisions

1003.5.4.1 The Fire Chief may re-
quire the ingtdlation of an automatic fire
system when there is a change in the
character of the occupancy or use of any

0229

37

iﬂmmm, »



37

building which increases or may cause to
increase the hazard of fire or threat to
life or safety.

1003.5.4.2 The Fire Chief may re-
quire the ingtallation of an automatic fire
system when any dteration or change in
the use of a building or portion thereof
changes access to property so as to im-
pede the fire department’s ability to
control a fire.

10035.5 Local Conditions. The pro-
visions of this Section are justified by
local conditions, as more particularly set
forth in the Resolution adopted by the
Board of Directors of the Fire District
prior to enactment of this Code.
(Ord. 4549 § 1 (part), 1999)
792.230 UFC Section 1109.7
amended-Sparks from
chimneys.

UFC Section 1109.7 is amended to read
as follows:

Chimneys used with fireplaces or
heating appliances in which solid or
liquid fuel is used shall be maintained
with a spark arrester as required for
incinerators by the Mechanical Code.
(Ord. 4549 § 1 (part), 1999)
7.92.240 UFC Section 5204.5.2
amended-M aximum
capacity within established
limits.

UFC Section 5204.5.2 amended to read
as follows:

Within the limits established by law
restricting the storage of CNG for the

363

ATTACHMENT 5 <«

7.92.220

protection of heavily populated or con-
gested commercial aress, the aggregate
capacity of any one instalation shall not
exceed 183,000 cubic feet (518 1974 L)
except as approved by the chief within
the areas zoned for such use.
(Ord. 4549 § 1 (part), 1999)
7.92.250 UFC Section 7401.6.4 No.
1 amended-Securing
compressed gas
containers, cylinders and
tanks.
UFC Section 7401.6.4 No. 1 is amended
to read as follows:

1 Securing containers, cylinders
and tanks to afixed object with two or
more non-combustible restraints.
(Ord. 4549 § 1 (part), 1999)
7.92.260 UFC Section 7701.1
amended-Scope.

UFC Section 7701.1 is amended to read
as follows:

The manufacture, possession, storage,
sde, transportation and use of explosives
and blasting agents is prohibited in all
areas of the County of Santa Cruz except
those designated for zoning purposes as
M-2 (Heavy Industria).

EXCEPTIONS:

1. The armed forces of the Unit-
ed States, Coast Guard or Nationd
Guard.

2. Explosives in forms pre-

scribed by the official United States
Pharmacopoeia.

(SantaCruz COUNLY 9-99)

0230



7.92.260

3. The possession, transportation,
storage and use of small arms ammuni-
tion when packaged in accordance with
DOT packaging requirements.

4. The possession, storage, trans-
portation and use of not more than 5
pounds (2.27) kg of commercially manu-
factured sporting black powder, 20
pounds (9.07 kg) of smokeless powder
and 10,000 small arms primers for hand
loading of small arms ammunition for
persona  consumption.

5. The transportation and use of
explosive materials by the United States
Bureau of Mines, and federal, state and
local law enforcement and fire agencies
acting in their officia capacities.

6. Special industrial explosive
devices which in the aggregate contain
less than 50 pounds (22.7 kg) of explo-
sSve materials.

7. The possession, transportation,
storage and use of blank industria power
load cartridges when packaged in accor-
dance with DOT packaging regulations.

8. When preempted by federal or
state regulations.

9. The use and handling of Class
B (Explosives, Division 1.2 or 1.3—see
Appendix VI-E) fireworks as set forth in
Article 78.

10. Temporary storage, transpor-
tation or use in connection with approved
blasting operations.

7.92.270

7.92280

CSuMENT B

UFC Section 7902
amended-L ocations
where aboveground tanks
are prohibited.

UPC Section 7902.2.2.1 is amended to

read as follows:

Class | and Il liquids in aboveground
tanks outside of buildings shall be stored
in listed and approved vaulted tanks. The
tank(s) shall have an interstitial space
capable of manual and/or electronic
monitoring. The tanks(s) shah be in-
dalled only in those areas zoned for such
use and shdl be approved by the chief.

(Ord. 4549 § 1 (part), 1999)

UFC Section 8204.2
amended-M aximum
capacity within established
limits.

UPC Section 8204.2 is amended to read

as follows:

Within the limits established by law
restricting the storage of LP-gas for the
protection of heavily populated or con-
gested commercid aress, the aggregate
capacity of any one ingtallation shall not
exceed a 2,000-gallon (7571 L) water
capacity except as approved by the chief
within the areas zoned for such use.

(Ord. 4549 § 1 (part), 1999)

0231 &

Pl
ot A

(Ord. 4549 § 1 (part), 1999)

(Santa Cruz County 9-99) 364

37



37

792.290

7.92300

UFC Appendix 11-A
amended--Suppression
and control of hazardous
fire areas, Section 7, spark
arresters.

See Section 7.92.230 of this chapter.

(Ord. 4549 § 1 (part), 1999)

UFC Section 9501
added-Violation-Public
nuisance-Abatement-
costs.

Section 9501 is added to read as follows:

In addition to the effects of violations
enumerated in Article 1 of the Uniform
Fire Code, any violation of the Fire Code
shdl be deemed a public nuisance pursu-
ant to Santa Cruz County Code Section
1.12.030 and/or the Santa Cruz County
Fire Department’s Code. In the event that
a public nuisance is not abated in accor-
dance with the Fire Chiefs order or the
order of the Board of Appedls, if any, the
Fire Chief may, upon securing approva
of the Board of Directors of the Fire
Digtrict, proceed to abate the nuisance by
force account, contract, or any other
method deemed most expedient by the
Board. The cost of such abatement may
be charged to the owner of record, or
assessed to the property in a manner
provided in Sections 1.14.040 through
1.14.070 of the County of Santa Cruz
Code.

(Ord. 4549 § 1 (part), 1999)

365

7.92310

7.92320

ATTACHMENT B

7.92.290

[JFC Section 9502
added—Violation—
Penalty.

Section 9502 is added to read as follows.

Unless otherwise provided, it is un-
lawful for any person, finn or corporation
to violate any of the provisions of the
code as adopted in this chapter, or to fail
to comply with any order made thereun-
der, or any certificate or permit issued
thereunder, or to fail to comply with an
order by the Board of Appeals, estab-
lished by Section 103.1.4 of the Uniform
Fiie Code and section 103.1.4.1.1 of this
code, or to fal to comply with an order
of the court of competent jurisdiction
within the time fixed therein and shall be
guilty of a misdemeanor and is subject to
the bail as outlined by the County of
Santa Cruz Court. Every such violation
shall be deemed a infraction or misde-
meanor in accordance with Chapter 1.12
of the Santa Cruz County Code.

(Ord. 4549 § 1 (part), 1999)

UFC Section 9503
added-Enfor cement.
Section 9503 is added to read as follows:

The Fire Chief and her/his delegated
subordinates, pursuant to the provisions
of Section 836.5 of the Penal Code of
the State of California, are hereby autho-
rized to arrest a person without a warrant
whenever they have reasonable cause to
believe that the person has committed an
infraction in their presence which isa
violation of any of the provisons of this
Chapter. Upon making such an arret, the
Fire Chief or her/his delegated subordi-
nate shall prepare a citation and releasse

(Santa Cruz County 9-99)

0232



ATTACHMENT &

7.92.320 0233

the person arrested pursuant to Section
853.6 of the Pena Code of the State of
Cdlifornia, the provisions of which are
hereby adopted by reference as part of
this Section.

(Ord. 4549 §1 (part), 1999)

;IO‘“!”""
i \

(Santa Cruz County 9-99) 366 3 z



ATTACHMENT &

Fire Chiefs Association of 023
% FIRE PREVENTION OFFICERS SECTION Santa Cruz County

February 1, 2001

Santa Cruz County Board of Supervisors
C/O Supervisor Tony Campos, Chairman
701 Ocean Street

Santa Cruz, CA 95060

Chairman Campos,

Before your Board is a proposal to revise the Santa Cruz County Code, specifically §16.20.180. A study
group comprised of representatives from the Planning Department, Public Works, and the fire service has
worked cohesively with a common goal in mind, “to resolve conflicts within our respective codes and
ordinances.” These changes are the product of this joint effort.

It is our belief that the public will be better served by these changes, and that the requirements for new
private roads, driveways, and bridges will be easier to understand, meet, and enforce. As you see, this
section addresses new roads, driveways, and bridges which require a grading permit. However, as we all
know, roads are usually permanent and do require a certain amount of maintenance. In some cases,
these may require upgrades because of changes in use and traffic. With this in mind, it is the intent of the
study group to continue meeting to address and develop common sense standards for existing roads.
Once these standards are developed, they will be brought forth for your approval.

The fire service representatives who served on this study group would also like to let you, as the Board of
Supervisors, know that it was a pleasure to work with both the Public Works and Planning Department
representatives on this project and that they are looking forward to continuing to work in resolving these
types of conflicts. With cooperation and a common sense approach to resolve such conflicts, our
communities will be better served, improving safety.

The Santa Cruz County Fire Chiefs Association and the Fire Prevention Officers Section would like to
encourage your Board to adopt the proposed revisions to §16.20.180 of the Santa Cruz County Code as
presented by the Planning Director.

Sincerely,

L3
4

Ron Rickabaugh, President
Fire Chiefs Association of Santa Cruz County

f/cffif%//zz/

’/Jeanette LinBert, President
Fire Prevention Officers Section

37



RYTATHMENY 7
County of Santa Cruz 0235

PLANNING DEPARTMENT

701 OCEAN STREET, 4™ FLOOR, SANTA CRUZ, CA 95060
(831) 454-2580 FAX: (831) 454-2131  TDD: (831) 454-2123

ALVIN D. JAMES. DIRECTOR

September 19, 2000

AGENDA: September 26, 2000

Board of Supervisors
County of Santa Cruz

701 Ocean Street

Santa Cruz, California 95060

SUBJECT: PUBLIC OUTREACH PROGRAM RELATING TO THE REVISED RURAL
ROAD STANDARDS

Members of the Board:

On December 14, 1999, your Board adopted a number of policy and ordinance amendments
relating to the regulation of timber harvesting in Santa Cruz County. These included adding the
Commercial Agricultural (CA) zone district as a zone district where timber harvesting is allowed,
establishing locational standards for helicopter logging, establishing locational criteria (riparian)
for timber harvesting, and revising the rural road standards. Following adoption by your Board,
this package of amendments was forwarded to the Coastal Commission for its review. In May
2000, the Coastal Commission adopted the revised road standards as a minor amendment. The
remaining portion of the County’s amendment package is tentatively scheduled for Coastal
Commission review in October 2000.

On June 20, 2000, your Board directed Planning staff to present a report outlining the efforts the
Department was undertaking to educate and facilitate the implementation of the recently adopted
standards. Since the early part of this year, however, Planning staff has been involved in
discussions with the Santa Cruz County Fire Chiefs Association regarding the revised road
standards and other issues regarding fire safety and roadways in the County. The Fire Chiefs
Association has concerns about the ability of their vehicles to negotiate roads with the proposed
surfacing. Planning staff is meeting with the Fire Chiefs Association on a monthly basis to resolve
these concerns and others regarding minimum road standards, road standard exceptions, and
inspection responsibilities. Following the discussions with the Fire Chiefs Association, Planning
staff will present a report to your Board regarding the rural road surfacing standards and any
other road-related fire safety issue that may need to be addressed.

Page 1

37




ATTACHMENT "y

It is, therefore, RECOMMENDED that your Board defer consideration of an implementation plan 0236
for the revised road standards until the concerns of the Santa Cruz County Fire Chiefs Association
have been resolved.

Sincerely,

A/Z/\) A RN
Alvin D. Jam : m

Planning Dire

RECOMMENDED:

Susan A. Mauridlo
County Administrative Officer

ADI/MMD/bs091200roads3. wpd

Page 2

3%




ini '

County of Santa Cruz

PLANNING DEPARTMENT

701 OCEAN STREET, 4” FLOOR, SANTA CRUZ, CA 85060
(831) 464-2680 FAX: (831) 4542131 TDD: (831) 4542123

ALVIN D. JAMES, DIRECTOR

November 15, 2000
AGENDA: December 5, 2000

Board of Supervisors
County of Santa Cruz

701 Ocean Street

Santa Cruz, California 95060

SUBJECT: PUBLIC OUTREACH PROGRAM RELATING TO THE REVISED RURAL
ROAD STANDARDS

Members of the Board:

On August 12, 2000, your Board deferred consideration of an implementation plan for the revised
road standards and directed Planning staff to report back on today’s agenda.  Staff is having
ongoing discussions with the Santa Cruz County Fire Chiefs Association regarding their concerns
with the road standards. These discussions will be completed early next year, when staff will be
presenting to your Board a report on the issues regarding the existing road standards. Until then,
it is premature to implement the revised road standards.

It is, therefore, RECOMMENDED that your Board defer consideration of an implementation plan
for the revised road standards while the concerns of the Santa Cruz County Fire Chiefs
Association are being resolved, and direct staff to present a report on February 27, 2001,
regarding the road standards and the concerns of the Fire Chiefs Association.

Sincerely, j
.y

Alvin D. Jam&

Planning Director

RECOMMENDED: @N\Q’\ J

Susan A. Mauriello
County Administrative Officer

87




